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Specters of War looks at the way war has been brought to the screen in various genres and at different

historical moments throughout the twentieth century and into the twenty-first. Elisabeth Bronfen asserts that

Hollywood has emerged as a place where national narratives are created and circulated so that audiences can

engage with fantasies, ideologies, and anxieties that take hold at a given time, only to change with the

political climate.

Such cultural reflection is particularly poignant when it deals with America’s traumatic history of

war. The nation has no direct access to war as a horrific experience of carnage and human destruction; we

understand our relation to it through images and narratives that transmit and interpret it for us. Bronfen does

not discuss actual conflicts but the films by which we have come to know and remember them, including All

Quiet on the Western Front, The Best Years of Our Lives, Miracle at St. Anna, The Deer Hunter, and Flags

of Our Fathers. Battles and campaigns, the home front and women-who-wait narratives, war correspondents,

and court martials are also explored as instruments of cultural memory. Bronfen argues that we are haunted

by past wars and by cinematic re-conceptualizations of them, and reveals a national iconography of

redemptive violence from which we seem unable to escape.
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From reader reviews:

Lawanda Beverly:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Specters of War: Hollywood's Engagement with
Military Conflict, you can enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named
reading friends.

Peter Chatman:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, small story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Specters of War: Hollywood's
Engagement with Military Conflict that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading
this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world much
better then how they react towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading practice only for
the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you
who want to start reading through as your good habit, you could pick Specters of War: Hollywood's
Engagement with Military Conflict become your own personal starter.

Joseph Russell:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Specters of War: Hollywood's Engagement
with Military Conflict book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which might
be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question Specters of War: Hollywood's
Engagement with Military Conflict as good book not simply by the cover but also by content. This is one
book that can break don't determine book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick
this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet
another sixth sense.

Mohammed Strohl:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Specters of War: Hollywood's
Engagement with Military Conflict which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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