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Providing abundance is humanity’s grandest challenge—this is a book about how we rise to meet it.

 

We will soon be able to meet and exceed the basic needs of every man, woman and child on the planet.
Abundance for all is within our grasp. This bold, contrarian view, backed up by exhaustive research,
introduces our near-term future, where exponentially growing technologies and three other powerful forces
are conspiring to better the lives of billions. An antidote to pessimism by tech entrepreneur turned
philanthropist, Peter H. Diamandis and award-winning science writer Steven Kotler. 

Since the dawn of humanity, a privileged few have lived in stark contrast to the hardscrabble majority.
Conventional wisdom says this gap cannot be closed. But it is closing—fast. The authors document how four
forces—exponential technologies, the DIY innovator, the Technophilanthropist, and the Rising Billion—are
conspiring to solve our biggest problems. Abundance establishes hard targets for change and lays out a
strategic roadmap for governments, industry and entrepreneurs, giving us plenty of reason for optimism.

Examining human need by category—water, food, energy, healthcare, education, freedom—Diamandis and
Kotler introduce dozens of innovators making great strides in each area: Larry Page, Steven Hawking, Dean
Kamen, Daniel Kahneman, Elon Musk, Bill Joy, Stewart Brand, Jeff Skoll, Ray Kurzweil, Ratan Tata, Craig
Venter, among many, many others. 
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From reader reviews:

Jesus Thresher:

The book Abundance: The Future Is Better Than You Think make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book Abundance: The Future Is
Better Than You Think to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your personal
capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open up
and read a reserve Abundance: The Future Is Better Than You Think. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Gary Copeland:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is known to us that
book is very important for us. The book Abundance: The Future Is Better Than You Think seemed to be
making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The publication Abundance: The Future Is Better Than You Think is not only giving you
far more new information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your spend time
to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while using book Abundance: The Future Is Better Than You
Think. You never experience lose out for everything should you read some books.

Rachel Addison:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How individuals
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying a book
can help people out of this uncertainty Information specially this Abundance: The Future Is Better Than You
Think book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Jackie Thompson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that question was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know that
little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by book. Many kinds
of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims Abundance: The Future Is Better
Than You Think.
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