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Screening Gender on Children’s Television offers readers insights into the transformations taking place in
the presentation of gender portrayals in television productions aimed at younger audiences. It goes far
beyond a critical analysis of the existing portrayals of gender and culture by sharing media professionals’
action-oriented recommendations for change that would promote gender equity, social diversity and the
wellbeing of children.

Incorporating the author’s interviews with 135 producers of children’s television from 65 countries, this
book discusses the role television plays in the lives of young people and, more specifically, in developing
gender identity. It examines how gender images presented to children on television are intertwined with
important existential and cultural concerns that occupy the social agenda worldwide, including the promotion
of education for girls, prevention of HIV/AIDS and domestic violence and caring for ‘neglected’ boys who
lack healthy masculine role models, as well as confronting the pressures of the beauty myth.

Screening Gender on Children’s Television also explores how children’s television producers struggle to
portray issues such as sex/sexuality and the preservation of local cultures in a profit-driven market which
continually strives to reinforce gender segregation. The author documents pro-active attempts by producers
to advance social change, illustrating how television can serve to provide positive, empowering images for
children around the world.

Screening Gender on Children’s Television is an accessible text which will appeal to a wide audience of
media practitioners as well as students and scholars. It will be useful on a range of courses, including popular
culture, gender, television and media studies. Researchers will also be interested in the breadth of this cross-
cultural study and its interviewing methodology.
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From reader reviews:

Beverly McGahey:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Screening Gender on Children's Television: The Views of Producers around the World your brain
will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be
your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a guide then become one type conclusion and
explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The Screening Gender on Children's Television: The Views of
Producers around the World giving you another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving
you useful data for your better life in this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern this is your
body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a game. Do you want
to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Janelle Smith:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, and soon. The Screening Gender on Children's Television: The Views of Producers around the
World provide you with new experience in reading a book.

Johnathan Fuller:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Screening Gender on Children's Television: The
Views of Producers around the World can give you a lot of pals because by you checking out this one book
you have thing that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This book can be one
of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't learn,
by knowing more than different make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have Screening
Gender on Children's Television: The Views of Producers around the World.

Rosemarie Nicoll:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that query was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is Screening Gender



on Children's Television: The Views of Producers around the World.
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