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Summary

Metaprogramming in .NET is designed to help readers understand the basic concepts, advantages, and
potential pitfalls of metaprogramming. It introduces core concepts in clear, easy-to-follow language and then
it takes you on a deep dive into the tools and techniques you'll use to implement them in your .NET code.
You'll explore plenty of real-world examples that reinforce key concepts. When you finish, you'll be able to
build high-performance, metaprogramming-enabled software with confidence.

About the Technology

When you write programs that create or modify other programs, you are metaprogramming. In .NET, you
can use reflection as well as newer concepts like code generation and scriptable software. The emerging
Roslyn project exposes the .NET compiler as an interactive API, allowing compile-time code analysis and
just-in-time refactoring.

About this Book

Metaprogramming in .NET is a practical introduction to the use of metaprogramming to improve the
performance and maintainability of your code. This book avoids abstract theory and instead teaches you
solid practices you'll find useful immediately. It introduces core concepts like code generation and
application composition in clear, easy-to-follow language.

Written for readers comfortable with C# and the .NET framework—no prior experience with
metaprogramming is required.

Purchase of the print book comes with an offer of a free PDF, ePub, and Kindle eBook from Manning. Also
available is all code from the book.

What's Inside

Metaprogramming concepts in plain language●

Creating scriptable software●

Code generation techniques●

The Dynamic Language Runtime●

About the Authors

Kevin Hazzard is a Microsoft MVP, consultant, teacher, and developer community leader in the mid-
Atlantic USA. Jason Bock is an author, Microsoft MVP, and the leader of the Twin Cities Code Camp.

"An excellent way to start fully using the power of metaprogramming."—From the Foreword by Rockford
Lhotka, Creator of the CSLA .NET Framework
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From reader reviews:

Dan Gray:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This Metaprogramming in .NET book is readable simply by you who hate
those straight word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience
without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer regarding
Metaprogramming in .NET content conveys the idea easily to understand by many individuals. The printed
and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different available as it. So , do you even now
thinking Metaprogramming in .NET is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Gerald Rountree:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this publication. This Metaprogramming in .NET is
simple to develop you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not
have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you simpler to
read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when one buys this book.

Margaret Holt:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet.
Every year had been exactly added. This e-book Metaprogramming in .NET was filled in relation to science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has
different feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly feel enjoy
to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Thomas Morgan:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Metaprogramming in .NET to make your
current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the sensation about book and
looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through it.
Beside that the publication Metaprogramming in .NET can to be your friend when you're sense alone and
confuse with the information must you're doing of the time.
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