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Designated a Doody's Core Title!

This is a pithy, pocket-sized resource for students and practicing nurses alike that delivers the foundations of
evidence-based practice (EBP) and basic nursing research concepts in an easy-to-read, quick-access format.
It demystifies the research process with straightforward information presented in concise sentences and
bullet points. The book focuses on providing readers with the most practical information on EBP--including
how to get the best evidence quickly using various databases and includes coverage of both quantitative and
qualitative methods. At-a-glance charts categorize research and simple examples demonstrate concepts.

The second edition has been updated to reflect rapidly changing trends and stateof-the-art information in
EBP, including such new research methods as narrative inquiry and storytelling. Using proven, class-tested
content for both traditional and online courses, this updated edition includes guidance on how EBP is used to
obtain and retain Magnet status, and presents examples of how health care providers are integrating EBP into
their practice. The text differentiates between EBP and research, often a difficult distinction for students to
grasp. Extensive coverage of how EBP can be used to improve patient care includes many practical
examples. Every chapter includes the popular "Fast Facts in a Nutshell" feature, highlighting must-know
information. The book also provides background information on defining the "compelling question" which is
essential to finding the appropriate evidence-based material.

New to the Second Edition:

Reflects new trends, research methods, and state-of-the-art EBP information●

Includes guidance on how EBP is used to obtain and retain Magnet status●

Provides examples of how health care providers and hospitals are integrating EBP into their practice●

Differentiates between EBP and research●

Discusses how EBP can be used to improve patient care●
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From reader reviews:

Henry Major:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How
individuals to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book.
Studying a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this Fast Facts for Evidence-
Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell book because this book offers
you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it
everbody knows.

Percy Cole:

This Fast Facts for Evidence-Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell
usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of this Fast Facts for
Evidence-Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell can be one of many
great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you with
information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere
you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed types. Beside that this Fast Facts for Evidence-
Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell forcing you to have an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we understand it
useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Silvia Washington:

The actual book Fast Facts for Evidence-Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a
Nutshell will bring that you the new experience of reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is
very unique. If you try to find new book to learn, this book very acceptable to you. The book Fast Facts for
Evidence-Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more easily to
read the book.

Shane Dagostino:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Fast Facts for Evidence-Based Practice in
Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell to make your current reading is interesting. Your
own skill of reading proficiency is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose basic book to make
you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial
opinion for you to like to wide open a book and examine it. Beside that the guide Fast Facts for Evidence-
Based Practice in Nursing, Second Edition: Implementing EBP in a Nutshell can to be your friend when



you're experience alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of these time.
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