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"I really like his main character, Alex McKnight, and I'm ready to revisit Paradise, Michigan."?James
Patterson

New York Times Bestselling Author of Die a Stranger

Steve Hamilton's novels have won the mystery world's most prestigious awards. Now, in North of Nowhere,
he returns to Michigan's Upper Peninsula, where former Detroit cop Alex McKnight has learned that
wherever money goes, envy isn't far behind.

After a game of cards turns into a professional heist, Alex McKnight finds himself lying facedown on the
floor with a gun to the back of his head. When the dust settles, McKnight is one of the police chief's lead
suspects. Worse, one of the other card players has the same idea, and he has no qualms about exercising
some vigilante justice of his own. Now, Alex knows he is the only one who can uncover the truth. But he's
about to discover how dark this conspiracy truly is?or how close to guilt he actually stands. . . .
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From reader reviews:

Shannon Batiste:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel
(Alex McKnight Novels) can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus out of
date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?

Richard Swisher:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book and also novel and North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel
(Alex McKnight Novels) or even others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the
fantastic a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or
students especially. Those guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside
science publication, any other book likes North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel (Alex McKnight
Novels) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Joey Leigh:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. Through the book North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel (Alex McKnight Novels) we can
take more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? Being creative person must love to read a book. Just
simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life by this
book North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel (Alex McKnight Novels). You can more appealing than
now.

Sandra Fritz:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt it when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel
(Alex McKnight Novels) to make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is
developing when you including reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and
mingle the opinion about book and examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a
book and study it. Beside that the book North of Nowhere: An Alex McKnight Novel (Alex McKnight
Novels) can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse with the information must
you're doing of these time.
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