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The concentration of private power over media has been the subject of intense public debate around the
world. Critics have long feared waves of mergers creating a handful of large media firms that would hold
sway over public opinion and endanger democracy and innovation. But others believe with equal fervor that
the Internet and deregulation have opened the media landscape significantly. How concentrated has the
American information sector really become? What are the facts about American media ownership?

In this contentious environment, Eli Noam provides a comprehensive and balanced survey of media
concentration with a methodical, scientific approach. He assembles a wealth of data from the last 25 years
about mass media such as radio, television, film, music, and print publishing, as well as the Internet,
telecommunications, and media-related information technology. After examining 100 separate media and
network industries in detail, Noam provides a powerful summary and analysis of concentration trends across
industries and major media sectors. He also looks at local media power, vertical concentration, and the
changing nature of media ownership through financial institutions and private equity. The results reveal a
reality much more complex than the one painted by advocates on either side of the debate. They show a
dynamic system that fluctuates around long-term concentration trends driven by changing economics and
technology.

Media Ownership and Concentration in America will be essential reading and a trove of information for
scholars and students in media, telecommunications, IT, economics, and the history of business, as well as
media industry professionals, business researchers, and policy makers around the world. Critics and
defenders of media trends alike will find much that confirms and refutes their world view. But the next round
of their debate will be shaped by the facts presented in this book.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Rodrigue:

The book Media Ownership and Concentration in America can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book Media
Ownership and Concentration in America? A number of you have a different opinion about guide. But one
aim that will book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your
book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are able to share all of
these. Book Media Ownership and Concentration in America has simple shape but the truth is know: it has
great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is
very wonderful.

Calvin Williams:

This Media Ownership and Concentration in America book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it
the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this
book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get.
This particular Media Ownership and Concentration in America without we recognize teach the one who
studying it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Media Ownership and
Concentration in America can bring when you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out
to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Media Ownership and
Concentration in America having excellent arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Pamela Acuna:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Media Ownership and Concentration in America as
the daily resource information.

Brandon Gentry:

The publication with title Media Ownership and Concentration in America contains a lot of information that
you can study it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is important
to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the
glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.
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