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One high-level ability of the human brain is to understand what it has learned. This seems to be the crucial
advantage in comparison to the brain activity of other primates. At present we are technologically almost
ready to artificially reproduce human brain tissue, but we still do not fully understand the information
processing and the related biological mechanisms underlying this ability. Thus an electronic clone of the
human brain is still far from being realizable. At the same time, around twenty years after the revival of the
connectionist paradigm, we are not yet satisfied with the typical subsymbolic attitude of devices like neural
networks: we can make them learn to solve even difficult problems, but without a clear explanation of why a
solution works. Indeed, to widely use these devices in a reliable and non elementary way we need formal and
understandable expressions of the learnt functions. of being tested, manipulated and composed with These
must be susceptible other similar expressions to build more structured functions as a solution of complex
problems via the usual deductive methods of the Artificial Intelligence. Many effort have been steered in this
directions in the last years, constructing artificial hybrid systems where a cooperation between the sub
symbolic processing of the neural networks merges in various modes with symbolic algorithms. In parallel,
neurobiology research keeps on supplying more and more detailed explanations of the low-level phenomena
responsible for mental processes.
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From reader reviews:

Bobbi Gonzales:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book called From Synapses to Rules:
Discovering Symbolic Rules from Neural Processed Data? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You
already know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you
agree with it has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Michael Decker:

The book untitled From Synapses to Rules: Discovering Symbolic Rules from Neural Processed Data is the
publication that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be
shown to anyone. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer
was did a lot of study when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you personally is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of From Synapses to Rules: Discovering Symbolic Rules
from Neural Processed Data from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Betsy Aguilar:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This From Synapses to Rules:
Discovering Symbolic Rules from Neural Processed Data is simple to bring you can read it in the park, in the
beach, train along with soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the
particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Norma Baumgarten:

You will get this From Synapses to Rules: Discovering Symbolic Rules from Neural Processed Data by visit
the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get
difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by written or printed but in
addition can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking because
of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more
information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-
date. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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