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Greg Rich has traveled through time, become one of the legendary Musketeers, and—most recently—
prevented the Spanish army from attacking Paris. He should feel invincible. Instead, he and his friends
languish in prison, having stumbled into a trap set by Milady and the Prince of Condé.

But Greg didn't come to the seventeenth century to sit in a jail cell and await execution. He, Aramis, Athos,
and Porthos are Musketeers, and King Louis is in immediate danger of being overthrown by the scheming
prince. Faster than they can say "All for one, and one for all," the boys plot to break out of prison, defend
Louis, and return Greg and his parents to the twenty-first century.

Amid narrow escapes, flying arrows, and fiery explosions, the Musketeers battle to save the king— and
history itself. Because if the past changes, what happens to Greg's future?
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From reader reviews:

Cheryl Grosvenor:

The book The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross can give more knowledge and information about everything
you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross? Several
of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim this book can give many details for us. It is
absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, it
is possible to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross has
simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous
world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Lynn Jordan:

Here thing why this The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of
all reading through a book is good but it depends in the content of it which is the content is as yummy as
food or not. The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross giving you information deeper as different ways, you can
find any reserve out there but there is no reserve that similar with The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross. It
gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing that happened in the world
which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in area, café, or even
in your means home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form
of The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross in e-book can be your alternative.

Bertha Franke:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross
book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred percent
guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Anne Corchado:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross was
colourful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Last Musketeer #3: Double Cross
has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you
can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any
it offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that will.
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