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Metaphors and analogies are more than figurative language suitable only for English classes and
standardized test questions. They are power tools" that can electrify learning in every subject and at all grade
levels. Metaphors show students how to make connections between the concrete and the abstract, prior
knowledge and unfamiliar concepts, and language and image. To exploit these powers, however, teachers
must learn how to use metaphors and analogies strategically and for specific purposes, helping students
discover, create, and deconstruct effective comparisons. In this thoughtful and nuanced book, Rick Wormeli
examines a wide range of powerful metaphors--from the rhetoric of political speeches to mathematical
models to concrete spellings and body sculptures that symbolically portray abstractions. Metaphors &
Analogies is filled with provocative illustrations of metaphors in action and practical tips about using
metaphors to improve assessment, professional development, and symbolic sensing. Imagine the possibilities
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Taylor:

The event that you get from Metaphors & Analogies: Power Tools for Teaching Any Subject will be the
more deep you digging the information that hide inside words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it.
It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Metaphors & Analogies: Power Tools for Teaching
Any Subject giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in specific way
that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this book is well-known
enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go to
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this specific
Metaphors & Analogies: Power Tools for Teaching Any Subject instantly.

John Masterson:

The reason? Because this Metaphors & Analogies: Power Tools for Teaching Any Subject is an unordinary
book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you with the
secret the idea inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
awesome way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret
it. This amazing book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book possess such as help improving your
ability and your critical thinking way. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go
to the publication store hurriedly.

James Sanford:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. 1 activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Metaphors & Analogies: Power Tools for
Teaching Any Subject, you could enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still desire to miss it? What
kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on
its known as reading friends.

Anthony Koch:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that question
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you also
know that little person just like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually Metaphors &
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