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In this "concise philosophy of the machine," Gerald Raunig provides a historical and critical backdrop to a
concept proposed forty years ago by the French philosophers Félix Guattari and Gilles Deleuze: the machine,
not as a technical device and apparatus, but as a social composition and concatenation. This conception of
the machine as an arrangement of technical, bodily, intellectual, and social components subverts the
opposition between man and machine, organism and mechanism, individual and community. Drawing from
an unusual range of films, literature, and performance--from the role of bicycles in Flann O'Brien's fiction to
Vittorio de Sica's Neorealist film The Bicycle Thieves, and from Karl Marx's "Fragment on Machines" to the
deus ex machina of Greek drama--Raunig arrives at an enhanced conception of the machine as a social
movement, finding its most apt and concrete manifestation in the Euromayday movement, which since 2001
has become a transnational activist and discursive practice focused upon the precarious nature of labor and
lives.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Rubio:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book A Thousand Machines: A Concise Philosophy of
the Machine as Social Movement (Semiotext(e) / Intervention Series). You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of book A Thousand Machines:
A Concise Philosophy of the Machine as Social Movement (Semiotext(e) / Intervention Series). You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book
you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple
factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by
internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's
examine.

Vicki Shah:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday.
The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out look for
book, may be the guide untitled A Thousand Machines: A Concise Philosophy of the Machine as Social
Movement (Semiotext(e) / Intervention Series) can be fine book to read. May be it could be best activity to
you.

Violet Murray:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book A Thousand Machines: A Concise Philosophy of the
Machine as Social Movement (Semiotext(e) / Intervention Series) was vibrant and of course has pictures
around. As we know that book A Thousand Machines: A Concise Philosophy of the Machine as Social
Movement (Semiotext(e) / Intervention Series) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teens. For
example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not
at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the
best book for you personally and try to like reading which.

Irene Gamino:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the change information of year in order to year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. With
the book A Thousand Machines: A Concise Philosophy of the Machine as Social Movement (Semiotext(e) /
Intervention Series) we can take more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? For being creative



person must want to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't end up being
doubt to change your life at this book A Thousand Machines: A Concise Philosophy of the Machine as
Social Movement (Semiotext(e) / Intervention Series). You can more inviting than now.
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