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Proof of Divine presents the journey of author Andrew Murtagh as he straddles the fence between faith and
cynicism in an all-or-none look at the greatest story ever told. Blending his family's incredible stories of
survival, faith, hope, and love, matched with his own walk from hockey player to coach to husband, father,
and career man, he embarks on a five-year expedition towards the intersection of faith and reason. Is there a
God? Are science and faith mutually exclusive? What is truth and what of logic, morality, and meaning?
Who is the historical Jesus, and why Christianity? The faith of scientists, the science of skeptics, the
questions of time, life, and purpose, Murtagh looks back at his own life and the inspiring lives of his
forefathers to decide if he is an accident or an intention. The graze of a bullet, a soldier surrounded, an armed
robbery, and a fateful desert drive-Murtagh puts the faith of his youth to the ultimate test: the Proof of
Divine. "Told in a warm, personal way, Murtagh's pilgrimage is laced with evidence, argumentation, and fair
assessment of the evidence for and against belief-Proof of Divine will engage the reader, challenge
unbelievers and strengthen believers. I highly recommend it" -J.P. Moreland, Distinguished Professor of
Philosophy, Biola University "This wonderfully-written account is that of a man pursuing the journey of life,
in a quest to find ultimate meaning in the universe. It was exceptionally difficult to put down-Murtagh knows
how to punch the right buttons There is something here for everyone and I recommend it highly" -Gary R.
Habermas, Distinguished Professor of Philosophy and Theology, Liberty University "I love this book and the
intellectual honesty and humility of the author The caution and finesse with which the author stayed within
the limits of science and logic was impressive-Andrew is a story teller par excellence-A must read" -Steve A
Johnson, Professor of
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From reader reviews:

Marcus Musick:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for people. The book Proof of Divine: The Journey of a Common
Man's Search for the FingerPrint of God ended up being making you to know about other knowledge and of
course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication Proof of Divine:
The Journey of a Common Man's Search for the FingerPrint of God is not only giving you much more new
information but also to be your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own personal spend time
to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Proof of Divine: The Journey of a Common
Man's Search for the FingerPrint of God. You never experience lose out for everything in case you read
some books.

Martha Doughty:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Proof of Divine: The Journey of
a Common Man's Search for the FingerPrint of God is our recommendation to make you keep up with the
world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Vincent Newton:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Proof of Divine: The Journey of a Common Man's Search for the FingerPrint of God the mind will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe not known for but surely can be
your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a publication then become one form conclusion and
explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The Proof of Divine: The Journey of a Common Man's
Search for the FingerPrint of God giving you one more experience more than blown away the mind but also
giving you useful facts for your better life with this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern this
is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning an activity. Do you
want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Thomas Obrien:

This Proof of Divine: The Journey of a Common Man's Search for the FingerPrint of God is great reserve for
you because the content that is full of information for you who always deal with world and also have to make
decision every minute. This specific book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we
can claim no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it.
Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core information with



splendid delivering sentences. Having Proof of Divine: The Journey of a Common Man's Search for the
FingerPrint of God in your hand like getting the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous just one. We
can say that no book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So ,
this can be good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?
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