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Men of the Bible offers both men and women a fresh way to read and understand the Bible?through the eyes
and hearts of the men whose stories unfold in its pages. This unique book takes a close-up look at fifty-two
men in Scripture?complex flesh-and-blood characters whose strengths and weaknesses will seem strangely
similar to your own. Heroes and villains, sinners and prophets, commoners and kings … their dramatic life
stories provide you with a fresh perspective on the unfolding story of redemption. Though our culture differs
vastly from theirs, the fundamental issues we face in relation to God and the world remain the same. We still
reach for great dreams and selfish ambitions. We wrestle with fear and indecision, struggle with sexual
temptation, and experience the ache of loneliness and the devastation of betrayal. And, like many of these
men, we long to walk more closely with the God who calls us into an intimate relationship with himself and
who enables us to fulfill his purpose for our lives. Men of the Bible offers men and women today a unique
devotional experience that combines five elements. Each week becomes a personal retreat focused on the life
of a particular man: Monday: His Story?a narrative retelling of the biblical story Tuesday: A Look at the
Man?focusing on the heart of the man and how his story connects with your own life Wednesday: His
Legacy in Scripture?a Bible study on principles revealed through the life of the man Thursday: His Legacy
of Promise?Bible promises that apply to his life and yours Friday: His Legacy of Prayer?praying in light of
his story Designed for personal prayer and study or for use in small groups, Men of the Bible will help you
make Bible reading a daily habit. Whether you dip into portions or read every page, this book will help you
grow in character, wisdom, and obedience as a person after God’s own heart.
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From reader reviews:

Vickie Reed:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How
individuals to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book.
Reading through a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Men of the
Bible: A One-Year Devotional Study of Men in Scripture book as this book offers you rich info and
knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
know.

Albert Christensen:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is
this Men of the Bible: A One-Year Devotional Study of Men in Scripture.

James Jones:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the list of books
in the top collection in your reading list is usually Men of the Bible: A One-Year Devotional Study of Men
in Scripture. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into
precious person. By looking upward and review this e-book you can get many advantages.

Brandon Seymour:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen want book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. With the book Men of the Bible: A One-Year Devotional Study of Men in Scripture we can get more
advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must want to read a book.
Simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life with
that book Men of the Bible: A One-Year Devotional Study of Men in Scripture. You can more desirable than
now.
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