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A murder arranged as a suicide ... a missing deed ... and a bereft daughter whose sheltered world is shattered.
August, 1869: Lily Granville is stunned by her father's murder. Only one other person knows about a
valuable California gold mine deed -- both are now missing. Lily heads west on the newly opened
transcontinental railroad, determined to track the killer. She soon realizes she is no longer the hunter but the
prey.

As things progress from bad to worse, Lily is uncertain who to trust--the China-bound missionary who wants
to marry her, or the wandering Texan who offers to protect her ... for a price. Will Lily survive the journey
and unexpected betrayal?
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From reader reviews:

Fred Dean:

The book Double Crossing make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable
considerably more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem
with the subject. If you can make studying a book Double Crossing to get your habit, you can get much more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like available and read a reserve Double Crossing. Kinds of book are several. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Agnes Shivers:

The book Double Crossing can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just
why must we leave the good thing like a book Double Crossing? A number of you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to
closer with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible
to share all of these. Book Double Crossing has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Jenny Perez:

You can find this Double Crossing by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it
could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various.
Not only simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the
modern era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right
now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Kimberly Hutton:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news.
In this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just searching for the Double Crossing when you desired it?
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