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Anyone can master the fundamentals of game design - no technological expertise is necessary. The Art of
Game Design: A Book of Lenses shows that the same basic principles of psychology that work for board
games, card games and athletic games also are the keys to making top-quality videogames. Good game
design happens when you view your game from many different perspectives, or lenses. While touring
through the unusual territory that is game design, this book gives the reader one hundred of these lenses - one
hundred sets of insightful questions to ask yourself that will help make your game better. These lenses are
gathered from fields as diverse as psychology, architecture, music, visual design, film, software engineering,
theme park design, mathematics, writing, puzzle design, and anthropology. Anyone who reads this book will
be inspired to become a better game designer - and will understand how to do it.
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From reader reviews:

Rosa Tarpley:

Here thing why that The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses are different and dependable to be yours.
First of all looking at a book is good but it really depends in the content than it which is the content is as
tasty as food or not. The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses giving you information deeper and different
ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no guide that similar with The Art of Game Design: A
book of lenses. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this
happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like
in playground, café, or even in your way home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the
imprinted book maybe the form of The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses in e-book can be your
substitute.

George Cornelius:

The guide with title The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses posesses a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This book exist new know-how the information that
exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth.
You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Joanna Bowen:

Beside this particular The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses in your phone, it could give you a way to
get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh
from oven so don't be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have
The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses because this book offers to you personally readable information.
Do you oftentimes have book but you rarely get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to
happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book and read it from now!

Leon Bailey:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just seeking the The Art of Game Design: A book of lenses when you desired it?
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