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Christian Identity, Jews, and Israel in 17th-Century England is a cultural history of seventeenth-century
England. It assesses the complexity and fluidity of Christian identity from the reign of Elizabeth I and the
early Stuart kings through the English Revolution, and into the Restoration, when the English Church and
monarchy were restored. Throughout this tumultuous period, which included debate about readmission of the
Jews, England was preoccupied with Jews and Israel. As the Reformation sharpened national identity and
prompted reconsideration of the relation of Christianity to Judaism, English people showed intense interest in
Jewish history and Judaism and appropriated biblical Israel's history, looking to the narratives in the Hebrew
Bible, even as reformed Christianity was thought to be purged of Jewish elements. There was an unstable,
shifting mix of identification and opposition, affinity and distance, in English attitudes towards Jews - a mix
that held positive possibilities for Jewish/Christian relations as well as negative. Grounded in archival
research, this book analyzes writings ranging from those of Foxe and Hooker to Milton and Dryden, from
sermons to lyrics, from church polemic to proposals for legal and economic reform. Literary texts discussed
include Herrick's Hesperides, Vaughan's Silex Scintillans, Bunyan's Grace Abounding, Milton's major prose
and poems, and Dryden's Annus Mirabilis and Absalom and Achitophel. Attention is also paid to publications
associated with James I, Charles I, and Cromwell, and writings by and about such figures as William Prynne,
Gerrard Winstanley, Margaret Fell, George Fox, Menasseh Ben Israel, and self-proclaimed prophets such as
John Rogers, Abiezzer Coppe, and Anna Trapnel.
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From reader reviews:

Janet Smith:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question mainly
because just their can do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular Christian Identity, Jews, and
Israel in 17th-Century England to read.

Joe Stearns:

The ability that you get from Christian Identity, Jews, and Israel in 17th-Century England may be the more
deep you excavating the information that hide inside words the more you get serious about reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Christian Identity, Jews, and Israel in 17th-Century
England giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in particular way that can
be understood simply by anyone who read that because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along, both
in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this Christian Identity, Jews, and Israel in
17th-Century England instantly.

Tara Gamboa:

The publication with title Christian Identity, Jews, and Israel in 17th-Century England contains a lot of
information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular
book exist new understanding the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the
world currently. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of
book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so
you can read this anywhere you want.

Jeffery Hall:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is called of
book Christian Identity, Jews, and Israel in 17th-Century England. Contain your knowledge by it. Without
making the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
significant that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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